
    

  

   MM734548
 MM735568

  FIT D-XD

SIZE RANGE 36-48

COLOR Black / Grey

UPPER MATERIAL Full Grain Leather

LINING MATERIAL Hydro-Tec®

Antibacterial/DryShield membrane

INSOLE Non woven Antistatic

INLAY SOLE Anti bacterial 

TOE CAP Fiberglass toe cap / EN

12568:2010

PROTECTIVE LAYER Woven zero penetration / EN

22568-4:2019

UPPER CONSTRUCTION Strobel-stitched

MIDSOLE PU

OUTSOLE PU | GripForce® Easy Twist

OUTER TOE CAP PU

FASTENING TYPE Laces Black/Grey RPET

WORKING 120 CM

EUROPEAN STANDARD EN ISO 20345:2011

ANTISTATIC PROPERTIES Antistatic 0,1 - 1000 M Ohm

ANTI-SLIP SRC

  

RYAN 
S3-Safetyshoe with sole plate

for wet work

  

WATERPROOF

The all-round safety boot:
extremely safe & comfortable,
100% metal free & waterproof.
The Ryan has everything you
would expect from a safety
boot; rugged and durable with
all day long comfort and
protection for your feet in all
conditions. This boot has a fully
waterproof membrane, so you
don't have to worry about wet
feet. You can fully concentrate
on getting the job done. The
reflective parts on the boot
ensure that you are clearly
visible in the dark and the
Gripforce outsole gives you
maximum grip. The extremely
cool carbon look on the side of
the upper gives the boot a
sporty look. It is available in 2
widths (D & XD).

  

Industries:Chemical industry,
Metal industry, Construction &
technology, Manufacturing,
Nature & environment, 

 


