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  FIT 
SIZE RANGE 50-53

COLOR Black

UPPER MATERIAL Full Grain Leather

LINING MATERIAL Full grain Nappa leather / Split

leather

INSOLE Leather vegatable retanned,

integrated steel shank

INLAY SOLE Anti bacterial 

TOE CAP Steel / EN ISO 22568-1:2019

PROTECTIVE LAYER Stainless Steel / EN

22568-3:2019

UPPER CONSTRUCTION Lasted

MIDSOLE None

OUTSOLE Nitril rubber / HRO

OUTER TOE CAP PU

FASTENING TYPE Laces Black/Grey RPET

WORKING 120 CM

EUROPEAN STANDARD EN ISO 20345:2011 

ANTISTATIC PROPERTIES Antistatic 0,1 - 1000 M Ohm

ANTI-SLIP SRA

  

MITCHEL XL 
S3-Safetyshoe with sole plate

for wet work

  

XL sizing, XL safety and XL
comfort

The Mitchel XL has been
created to offer the same
standards of comfort and fit as
the standard sized Mitchel but
with a broader range of sizing
options. It's virtually
impenetrable making it an ideal
choice of shoe for working with
metal, whether you're welding,
brazing or smelting. An
integrated steel toe cap
protects feet from falling pieces
of metal and other objects. No
compromise nitrile rubber soles
resist corrosive substances and
extreme temperatures. And for
additional peace of mind
protection, the Mitchel also
comes with the option of flame
proof laces.

Industries:Metal industry,
Nature & environment, 

 


